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Bid Opening:  11:00 A.M., Tuesday, May 10, 2011

Project: QC213-010 Interior Renovation — Rosenthal Library — Queens College

Facilities Planning, Construction,
and Management

Office of Financial Management
Procurement Services

555 West 57" Street 11" Floor
New York, New York 10019

Tel: 212-541-0936

Bidder

Total Base Bid

Alternate 1

Alternate 2

Alternate 3

AMG Demolition
330 Sunrise Hwy
Rockville Center, NY 11570

Aversa Bros Ind. Contracting
52 Lenzie Street
Staten Island, NY 10312

MBI Group
48 West 37" Street
New York, NY 10018

GP Land and Carpet Corp.
5905 Lake Road South
Brookport, NY 14420

Camelot Communications Group
2 Washington St,
New York, NY 10004

J. M Corporate Painter
1992 Commerce St # 231
Yorktown Hts, NY 10598
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Bidder Total Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 Alternate 3

Deb Romain Consulting LLC.
P. O Box
190 Tuckahoe, NY 10707

Handy Andy H. I.

87-18 Santiago St $1,781,400.00 $223,504.00 $41,929.00 $119,969.00
Hollis, NY 11423

Calcedo Construction Corp.
10 Midland Ave
Port Chester, NY 10573

RMR General Construction
250 Mineola Blvd
Mineola, NY

F & L Painting, LLC
14 Branford St.
Newark, NJ 07114

National Environmental Safely
Co.
12-17 38" Ave
Long Island City, NY 11101
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P & K Contracting Inc.
225 Jericho Tpk
Floral Park, NY 11001

Lanmark Group Inc.

2125 Mill Ave $1,525,000.00 $215,000.00 $49,000.00 $79,000.00
Brooklyn, NY 11234

North E Group

60 East 9" Street 51" FI $1,375,000.00 $218,000.00 $84,000.00 $98,000.00
New York, NY 10003

Arch Builders Developers Inc.
1545 E. 17™ Street
Brooklyn, NY 11230

Nehal Contracting, Inc.
81 Tennyson Dr.
Nanuet, NY 10954

A-Plus Construction
41-22 Fuller Place
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Nika Construction Group.com
370 North Clinton Street
East Orange, NJ 07017

Bulson Management LLC
636 Broadway
New York, NY 10012

United Force Construction
28 Commerce Street
Brooklyn, NY 11231

Demo Tec Mae
10 Roswell Ave
Oceanside, NY 11572

Positive Associate
40-33 23" Street
LIC, NY 11101

Laland Baptiste, LLC.
8513 Coventry Rd.
Brooklyn, NY 11236
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Ortega Group, LLC.
17 S.Macquesten Pkwy
Mt.Vernon, NY 10550

Icon Interiors

307 7" Avenue $1,991,000.00 $220,000.00 $73,000.00 $95,000.00
New York, NY 10001

Wenger Construction
91 Commercial Street
Plainveiw, NY 11803

Homeric Contracting
137-30 Rockaway Blvd.
South Ozone Park, NY 11436

Niko Development
170 Cherry Valley Ave
West Hempstead, NY 11552

Grid Span Corp
120 Jersey Ave
New Brunswick, NJ 08901
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Mechanical Electrical Corp
876 Jamaica Ave
Brooklyn, NY 11208

King Freeze LLC
127 W. 26" Street
New York, NY 10001

CC Technical Contracting Corp.
30-05 30" Ave
Astoria, NY 11102

Wager Contracting
30 Pleasant Street
New Rochelle, NY 10801

E.W Howell Co., LLC.
245 Newtown Road, Ste.600 NO BID
Plainview, NY 11803

Levest Electric Corp.
325 West 37" Street
New York, NY 10018
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BLH Construction Inc.
45-06 Little Neck Pkwy NO BID
Little Neck, NY 11362

A C S System Associates, Inc.

160 W. Lincoln Ave $1,484,000.00 $175,000.00 $72,000.00 $63,000.00
Mt. Vernon, NY 10550

Rockmore Contracting Corp
80 Remington Blvd
Ronkonkoma, NY 11779

Constructomics LLC.
45 West 21% Street
New York, NY 10010

On-Trac Construction Ass.
8860 Myrtle Ave
Glendale, NY 11385

RAMS Mechanical Inc.

50-02 97" PI. $1,876,000.00 $181,350.00 $34,600 $42,330.00
Corona, NY 11368
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Excel Interior
307 West 38" Street
New York, NY

$1,284,000.00

$192,000.00

$50,000.00

$73,000.00

GEM Construction & Restoration
Corp
723-15" Street
Union City, NJ 07087

$1,744,000.00

$257,500.00

$124,600.00

$144,400.00

C N A Enterprises, Inc.
35-56 11" Street
LIC, NY 11106

$1,473,982.00

$193,000.00

$64,740.00

$63,313.00

GII Construction Co. Inc.
3391 Merrick Rd.
Wantagh, NY 11793

$1,269,000.00

$195,000.00

$69,000.00

$79,000.00

Alps Mechanical, Inc.
51-20 59" Street
Woodside, NY 11377

$2,176,000.00

$373,550.00

$66,800.00

$173,900.00

Kayco Construction
36-51 Bell Blvd
Bayside, NY 11360
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Marson Contracting
414 E. 203" Rd.
Bronx, NY

Frazier & Sons Construction
LLC.
434 W. 164 Street
New York, NY

A & J Construction of NY, Inc.
163 Foxwood Rd
West Nyack, NY

A J S Construction, Inc.

149 Fifth Ave, $1,308,000.00 $194,000.00 $89,000.00 $99,000.00
New York, NY 10010

Tri-Rail Construction Inc.

142 Ralph Ave $1,362,000.00 $186,000.00 $88,000.00 $58,000.00
Copiague, NY 11726

Alpha Construction Resource Inc.
32 Leigh Street
Huntingville, NY
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Construction Force Services LLC.
30-64 Whitestone Exp.
Flushing, NY 11354

Touchtel Tech
42 Broadway

Quick Response Sprinklers
281 Maple Ave
Smithtown, NY 11287

Tekton Contracting Corp
2464 Wenner Place
Bronx, NY 10465

Interior Construction Corp.
314 Eight Street NO BID
New York, NY

N J D Wiring & Electric
213-08 99" Ave
Queens Village, NY
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Shri Mari Corporation
42-15 65" Place
Woodside, NY 11377

$1,425,000.00

$190,000.00

$50,000.00

$100,000.00

Tri dent Construction
998 Old Counrty Rd Ste.222
Plainview, NY 18003

Unique Woodworking Inc.
3519 Rombout Ave
Bronx, NY 10475

Remex Contracting Co.
3605 Marolla Place
Bronx, NY 10466

Petta Contracting
113 Mayor Haven Blvd.
Port Washington, NY 11050

EMK Contracting
204-06 32 Ave
Bayside, NY 11361

$1,469,000.00

$140,000.00

$40,000.00

$70,000.00
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The Urban Group
7608 Rockaway Blvd
Queens, NY 11421

Fratello Construction Corp

134 Milbar Blvd $1,497,000.00 $192,000.00 $66,000.00 $75,000.00
Farmingdale, NY 11735

Split Rock Associates
909 3" Ave, 5" FI.
New York, NY 10022

Zoom Contracting Inc.
41-30 37" Street
LIC, NY 11101

K. G. Industries Inc.
27-08 42" Rd
LIC, NY 11101

Earth Construction
213-08 99" Ave
Queens Village, NY
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Hudson Valley Env.
396 Whitehead Ave
South River, NJ 08882

Mongiove Associates
1978 Richmond Terrace
Staten Island, NY 10302

McGowan Builders
160 E. Union Ave
East Rutherford, NJ

NO BID

Northeast Service
56-01
Maspeth, NY 1378

Citywide Commercial Services
Inc.
1363-6 Lincoln Ave
Holbrook, NY

Arch Builders & Development
1545 East 17" Street
Brooklyn, NY 11230
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